
DATI PRINCIPALI

Cantiere/Modello Categoria

Lunghezza Larghezza

Anno immat. Anno costruzione

Velocità massima Velocità crociera

Zavorra Stazza

Dislocamento Pescaggio

HP Fiscali Scadenza RINA

Bandiera Visibilità

UsatoSunseeker PREDATOR 74 XPS

21,56 mt 1,8 mt

2023 2022

40 nodi 35 nodi

- -

5,38 t 1,83 mt

- -

British Turkey 

Euro 2.650.000Prezzo

COMBUSTIBILI E MOTORI

Nr. serbatoi Capacità serbatoi Materiale serbatoi

Motori Tipo carburante Ore moto

Revisione motori Tipo elica Trasmissione

2 4800 Still

MAN  2 x 1900 Diesel 112

Summer 2024 Bronze Linea d'asse

IDRAULICI

Serbatoi acqua Materiale serbatoi Tipo boiler

Dissalatore Autoclave Boiler

1 x 800 lt Plastic Electric

Presente Presente Presente

MATERIALE COSTRUZIONE

Scafo Tuga CopertaFiberglass Fiberglass Fiberglass 

ELETTRICI

Tensione Nr. batterie Capacità batterie

Generatore Carica batterie Inverter

220v - 24v - 12v 12 180 A

ONAN (27 Kw) Presente Presente

Note prezzo Iva non assolta vat not paid iva non pagada

BREVE DESCRIZIONE

Sunseeker predator 74, form 2023, boat in amazing condition - 

SCHEDA BARCA 00563188 Rif: 
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2023 model Sunseeker Predator 74 XPS model is on her second season of usage and only 90 hours on engines FOR SALE. Ultimate 
lifestyle has voice of speed. Imagine you decide to watch the sunset in Mykonos while you are on vacation in Bodrum. 2 hours of cruising 
will get you to your destination. 1900 hp x2 MAN V12 engines power up this beautiful gentlemen's sport yacht speeds up to 40 knots.

Delivered May 2023 to current owner, used only 3-4 months during the summer in Turkey- Greece waters and well kept on dry dock during 
the winter. She is currently cruising in Greece waters and will be available for showings by mid August in Bodrum, Turkey. The owner is 
moving up to 90 ft yacht already chosen, this deal will be a fast one.

DESCRIZIONE COMPLETA

DESCRIZIONE INTERNI

3 Cabins - 3 Toilets 

DESCRIZIONE ARMAMENTI

Platinum Mediterranean Package Hydraulic Telescopic gangway. Large Grey water storage tank option.

Upgraded Black Water tank capacity.

Electric Sunshade canopy for aft cockpit.

Hydraulic Bow thruster upgrade and Hydraulic Stern Thruster option.

Underwater lights x 4.
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Stern docking Winches.

Fresh water deck wash system.

Digital lock safe in master stateroom.

Additional pair of stern spring mooring cleats. Pair of Retractable Cleats for tender on platform. Bow Sunbathing Cushion folding back rest 
option.

XPS Special Edition Package

XPS Special Edition including exclusive interior architectural styling and exterior upholstery styling.

Enhancements to the Interior detailing have been indulged with the interior furniture, panelling and upholstery elements, include stainless 
steel details and backlit features.

The finishes are incorporating the latest Sunseeker exclusive collection. Carbon fibre detailing in table tops, ensign staff and console 
panels. Navigation lights are upgrade to LED.

Marine Electric Grill fitted in a drop down work station Carbon fibre and chrome platform overhead shower stand fitted into a pressurised 
deck socket Deck Saloon Flooring to have a Carpet Insert within the Starboard U Shape Sofa. Carpet B – Havana – White Rum 849772 
Preparation for future installation of a Water Maker. Seacocks and outlets blanked off. Fresh water feed to tank. Power supply Fold down 
platform seat Two Single beds with electrically operated slider to form an occasional double Interior carpet upgrade – Master, Forward and 
Starboard Guest Cabins Galley Work Top Upgrade – Quartz Platinum Collection Deck Saloon Bar Top Insert – Quartz Upgrade Platinum 
Collection

Interior Roman Blind Upgrade – Master, Forward and Starboard Guest Cabins Interior Lining Upgrade – Platinum Collection Full sea and 
system commissioning

DESCRIZIONE STRUMENTAZIONE
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2023 model Sunseeker Predator 74 XPS model is on her second season of usage and only 90 hours on engines FOR SALE. Ultimate 
lifestyle has voice of speed. Imagine you decide to watch the sunset in Mykonos while you are on vacation in Bodrum. 2 hours of cruising 
will get you to your destination. 1950 hp x2 MAN V12 engines power up this beautiful gentlemen's sport yacht speeds up to 40 knots.

Delivered May 2023 to current owner, used only 3-4 months during the summer in Turkey- Greece waters and well kept on dry dock during 
the winter. She is currently cruising in Greece waters and will be available for showings by mid August in Bodrum, Turkey. The owner is 
moving up to 90 ft yacht already chosen, this deal will be a fast one.

Delivered May 2023 Sunseeker Predator 74 XPS fitted with Twin Man V12 1950 (2 X 1950PS) engines and built to standard factory 
specification:

- Hull – White

- Hull Band and under water line – Jet Black

- Interior wood – Wenge Satin

Hull Band to be moulded in a colour other than the standard white Simrad IS42 Speed/Depth Instruments x2 with Sonar hob sounder 
module with B744V depth/speed/temperature transducer.

Simrad AP44 Autopilot system.

Simrad Two 19" MO19-T Multifunctional touch displays.

Simrad NSO processor.

Simrad OP50 Navigation Controller and Simrad GS25 GPS.

Simrad Halo 4 Pulse Compression Radar 64nm 4 foot open array radar scanner.

Simrad HS100 VHF Radio with DSC function with 2.4 meter whip antenna. Simrad AIS Module with GPS and 2.4 meter AIS VHF antenna.

Simrad Go- Free wireless bridge to control the NSO from your iPad or iPhone Compass Swinging and adjustment with correction card 
Rexroth Aventics - Marex OS 3D Joy stick docking system Aft docking station. Second Rexroth Aventics - Marex OS 3D Joy stick Radar 
Scanner and Radar Chair equipment including VHF aerials (minus the horn) to be sprayed Jet Black. The Radar scanner to be sprayed 
using LSA Jet Black.

Air Conditioning Tropical specification - 118,000 BTU with second shore power inlet Performance AV Package with Sonos audio zone 
system: 1. Saloon Samsung 55" UHD television with built in Apple TV App. Blu-ray player. 5:1 system with Proficient Protege sound bar with 
a Sonos Amp and Sonos Subwoofer. B&W CCM362 rear speakers and Sonos Amp. 2. Master stateroom Samsung 43" UHD television with 
built in Apple TV App. Blu-ray player and Proficient Protege sound bar with a Sonos Amp and Sonos Subwoofer. 3. Forward cabin Samsung 
43" UHD television with built in Apple TV App. Blu-ray player and Proficient Protege sound bar with

V

Page 3 of 10 a Sonos Amp. 4. Starboard Guest cabin 24" HD Television with a Blu-ray player and Sonos Amp with B&W CCM362 ceiling 
speakers. Apple TV. 5. Port Guest cabin option 24" HD Television with a Blu-ray player and Sonos Amp with B&W CCM362 ceiling 
speakers. Apple TV OR Lower saloon option is Samsung 32" Samsung Blu-ray player and Sonos Beam. Apple TV App. 6. Aft Cockpit zone 
with Four Sonance VPXT6R Extreme Speakers with Sonos Amp and Fore deck zone with Two Sonance VPXT6R Extreme and Sonos Amp. 
Note. The router is to provide access to the internet via Wi-fi or Cellular data and to allow the user to link to an available marina Wi-fi 
network. The boat can be fitted with up to 2 SIM cards (user supplied) to access the internet when in range of 3G-4G data signals. 
Entertainment Inverter and seamless transfer system. To run the boats entertainment system from the boats DC batteries.

Ceramic hob - Miele KM6520 FR 4 ring Wine cooler Victrifrigo DCW95 multi voltage (33 bottles) Miele WTF121 Washer-Dryer in the Crew 
Cabin Mini bar Refrigeration - Dometic HiPro 4000 230V 50Hz in the Master Walk in wardrobe Kenyon Electric BBQ grill B70061SS in the 
Cockpit Two Webasto Isotherm Cruise 36 24V 36 litre capacity drawer refrigerator with stainless steel front fitted under the fore deck 
seating Dimmer switches on interior and exterior overhead lighting Platform remote control with two hand sets supplied Chrome heated 
towel rail 700x400mm in the Master and Forward Toilet Compartmen Generator Onan 27kw 50Hz (27MDKDU) upgrade needed for 
upgraded air conditioning and or Stabilisers Sleipner SPS66B hull stabiliser unit with Vector Fin VF1050-1.05 metre. Run from hydraulic 
pump on both gearboxes whilst underway and at anchor by a 7.5kW ac motor powered by the generator through a variable speed drive 
Lewmar 50Kg Delta Galvanised Anchor and 90 Metres of 12mm Galvanised anchor chain Seabob stowage locker moulding under the 
starboard side sunbed Teak Side Decks to include the anchor deck and Seating group deck Teak fore deck table with fixed top fitted on a 
polished stainless steel leg Protective Covers Package - Foredeck sunpad cover, fore deck seating cover, fore deck table cover, aft cockpit 
sunpad cover, aft cockpit seating cover, aft cockpit table cover Fore deck seating group canopy with a manually operated stainless steel 
frame work and canvas cover Lower saloon and galley bar arrangement in lieu of the forward cabin walk in wardrobe Interior Wood Finish - 
Wenge Satin Wood flooring in lower lobby and step to the master cabin and the forward lobby up to the forward cabin door Sprung 
mattress for beds

NOTE AGGIUNTIVE

Delivered May 2023 Sunseeker Predator 74 XPS fitted with Twin Man V12 1950 (2 X 1950PS) engines and built to standard factory 
specification:

- Hull – White

- Hull Band and under water line – Jet Black

- Interior wood – Wenge Satin

Hull Band to be moulded in a colour other than the standard white
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IMMAGINI
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